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DATE: March 5, 2019

I. Open Session

1. Open Meeting - 6:15 p.m.

II. Pledge of Allegiance

III. Roll Call

IV. Presentations

1. Presentation of the 2018 Cumberland Police Department Officer of the Year Award to PFC Michael Allen Brown

2. Presentation from the Western Maryland Food Bank regarding the Chefs of Steel competition

V. Director's Reports

(A) Administrative Services

1. Administrative Services monthly report for January, 2019

VI. Approval of Minutes

1. Approval of the Regular Session Minutes of January 15, 2019

VII. Public Hearings

1. Public Hearing to receive requests from organizations seeking support through the City's hotel/motel funds

VIII. Unfinished Business

(A) Charter Amendment Resolutions

1. Charter Amendment Resolution (2nd and 3rd readings) - to repeal Charter Section 75 pertaining to carrying concealed 
weapons as prohibitions against carrying concealed weapons are set forth in Section 4-101 of the Criminal Law Article of 
the Annotated Code of Maryland

2. Charter Amendment Resolution (2nd and 3rd readings) - to repeal and reenact with amendments Charter Section 24 
pertaining to the publication of ordinances, when ordinances take effect, and the admissibility of codification in evidence

3. Charter Amendment Resolution (2nd and 3rd readings) - to repeal Charter Section 192-203 pertaining to the City's 
governance of the former Memorial Hospital

IX. New Business

(A) Orders (Consent Agenda)

1. Order accepting the bid of Burgmeier's Hauling, Inc. to provide twice a week, curbside garbage and recycling collection for 
three (3) years for an amount not to exceed $1,247,131.08 yearly, and bulk item pick-up for three (3) years for a rate of 
$115/hour; and accepting the bid of Mountainview Landfill to provide landfill services for accepting the City's solid waste 
for a cost of $35.25/ton - year 1, $36.31/ton- year 2, and $37.40/ton- year three

2. Order appointing Mayor and Council members and City staff as representatives and/or appointees to the City's boards and 
commissions

3. Order appointing members and alternates to the Evitts Creek Steering Committee

4. Order adopting a revised Sick and Safe Leave Policy for City employees to modify language pertaining to requirements for 
verification of sick leave for non-union employees



X. Public Comments

All public comments are limited to 5 minutes per person

XI. Adjournment



Regular Council Agenda

March 5, 2019

Description

Open Meeting - 6:15 p.m.

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



Regular Council Agenda

March 5, 2019

Description

Presentation of the 2018 Cumberland Police Department Officer of the Year Award to PFC 

Michael Allen Brown

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



Regular Council Agenda

March 5, 2019

Description

Presentation from the Western Maryland Food Bank regarding the Chefs of Steel competition

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



Regular Council Agenda

March 5, 2019

Description

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



Regular Council Agenda

March 5, 2019

Description

Administrative Services monthly report for January, 2019

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)























Regular Council Agenda

March 5, 2019

Description

Approval of the Regular Session Minutes of January 15, 2019

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)





















Regular Council Agenda

March 5, 2019

Description

Public Hearing to receive requests from organizations seeking support through the City's 

hotel/motel funds

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



Regular Council Agenda

March 5, 2019

Description

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



Regular Council Agenda

March 5, 2019

Description

Charter Amendment Resolution (2nd and 3rd readings) - to repeal Charter Section 75 

pertaining to carrying concealed weapons as prohibitions against carrying concealed weapons 

are set forth in Section 4-101 of the Criminal Law Article of the Annotated Code of Maryland

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

If passed, this Charter Amendment Resolution will become effective upon the 50th day after 

being passed unless a petition is submitted. 

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

 2nd Reading 

 3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)
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CHARTER AMENDMENT RESOLUTION NO. ________ 

 

 A RESOLUTION OF THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF 

CUMBERLAND, MARYLAND, ADOPTED PURSUANT TO THE AUTHORITY 

CONTAINED IN ARTICLE 11-E OF THE CONSTITUTION OF THE STATE OF 

MARYLAND AND SECTION 4-304 OF THE LOCAL GOVERNMENT ARTICLE OF 

THE ANNOTATED CODE OF MARYLAND ENTITLED “A RESOLUTION TO 

REPEAL SECTION 75 OF THE CHARTER OF THE CITY OF CUMBERLAND, 

MARYLAND (1991 EDITION) PERTAINING TO CARRYING CONCEALED 

WEAPONS.”   

 WHEREAS, the prohibition against carrying concealed weapons is set forth in 

state law (Section 4-101 of the Criminal Law Article of the Annotated Code of Maryland, 

as amended from time to time); and 

 WHEREAS, the prohibitions and penalties provided for in Section 75 of the 

Charter are preempted by the aforesaid state law and should be removed from the 

Charter. 

 NOW THEREFORE: 

 SECTION 1:  BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF 

CUMBERLAND, that Section 75 of the Charter of the City of Cumberland (1991 

Edition) be, and the same hereby is, repealed. 

 SECTION 2:  AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the date of the passage 

of this Resolution is _________, 2019, and the amendment of the Charter of the City of 

Cumberland hereby enacted shall become effective on __________, 2019, unless a 

proper petition for a referendum hereon shall be filed as provided by Section 4-304 of the 

Local Government Article of the Annotated Code of Maryland.  A complete and exact 

copy of this Resolution shall be continuously posted on the North Centre Street entrance 

of City Hall, Cumberland, Maryland, until ___________, 2019, and the title of this 

Resolution shall be published in a newspaper of general circulation in the City of 

Cumberland no less than four times, at weekly intervals, before the aforesaid date. 

 SECTION 3:  AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Mayor and City 

Council of Cumberland is hereby specifically directed to carry out the provisions of 

Section 2 hereof regarding the giving of notice by posting and publication of this 
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Resolution, approving the same, and, as evidence of said compliance, the City Clerk shall 

cause to be affixed to this Resolution a certificate of the publication in the newspaper in 

which the summary of this Resolution (i.e., its title) shall have been published, and the 

Mayor, if there is no petition for referendum, shall declare the Charter Amendment made 

to be effective on the effective date herein provided for, which is ____________, 2019, 

by affixing his signature hereto in the space provided below the effective date hereof. 

 SECTION 4:  AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that if a proper petition for 

referendum on the Charter Amendment herein proposed is filed, the Mayor and other 

proper officials of the City of Cumberland shall comply with applicable law, including, 

but not limited to, Subtitle 3 of Title 4 of the aforesaid Local Government Article. 

 SECTION 5:  AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that as soon as the Charter 

Amendment shall become effective, either as herein provided or following a referendum, 

the Mayor shall send separately, by registered mail, to the Secretary of the State of 

Maryland, the Maryland State Department of Assessments and Taxation and the 

Department of Legislative Reference of Maryland, a complete certified copy of the text 

of this Resolution, the date of the referendum, if any is held, a certificate showing the 

number of Councilpersons voting for and against it, and a report on the votes cast for or 

against the amendments hereby enacted at any referendum hereon, and the effective date 

of the Charter Amendment. 

 

 THIS RESOLUTION PASSED THIS ____ DAY OF _____________, 2019.   

 

      ___________________________ 

      Raymond F. Morris, Mayor 

 

ATTEST: 

 

______________________________ 

Marjorie A. Woodring, City Clerk 
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 The Charter Amendment enacted by the aforegoing Resolution became effective 

this ____ day of ____________, 2019. 

 

 

      ___________________________ 

      Raymond F. Morris, Mayor 

 

ATTEST: 

 

______________________________ 

Marjorie A. Woodring, City Clerk 

    

 

 

 

 I HEREBY CERTIFY, that the aforegoing Resolution, amending the Charter of 

the City of Cumberland, Maryland, was passed the ____ day of ___________, 2019, with 

____ votes in affirmation and ____ votes in the negative. 

 

      ____________________________ 

      Marjorie A. Woodring, City Clerk 

 

 

 

 I HEREBY CERTIFY, that the aforegoing is a true and exact copy of the Charter 

Amendment Resolution No. _____ passed by the Mayor and City Council of 

Cumberland, Maryland, in Regular Session on the ____ day of _____________, 2019. 
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 I FURTHER CERTIFY, that there was no petition for a referendum on the 

proposed amendment filed within the required time, and therefore, the same became 

effective on the ____ day of _____________, 2019.  

 

      ____________________________ 

      Marjorie A. Woodring, City Clerk  



Regular Council Agenda

March 5, 2019

Description

Charter Amendment Resolution (2nd and 3rd readings) - to repeal and reenact with 

amendments Charter Section 24 pertaining to the publication of ordinances, when ordinances 

take effect, and the admissibility of codification in evidence

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

If passed, this Charter Amendment Resolution will become effective upon the 50th day after 

being passed unless a petition is submitted. 

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

 2nd Reading 

 3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



CHARTER AMENDMENT RESOLUTION NO. ________ 

 

 A RESOLUTION OF THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF 

CUMBERLAND, MARYLAND, ADOPTED PURSUANT TO THE AUTHORITY 

CONTAINED IN ARTICLE 11-E OF THE CONSTITUTION OF THE STATE OF 

MARYLAND AND SECTION 4-304 OF THE LOCAL GOVERNMENT ARTICLE, 

ENTITLED “A RESOLUTION TO REPEAL AND REENACT WITH AMENDMENTS 

SECTION 24 OF THE CHARTER OF THE CITY OF CUMBERLAND, MARYLAND 

(1991 EDITION), PERTAINING TO THE PUBLICATION OF ORDINANCES, WHEN 

ORDINANCES TAKE EFFECT, AND THE ADMISSIBILITY OF CODIFICATION IN 

EVIDENCE.”  

 SECTION 1:  BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF 

CUMBERLAND, MARYLAND, that Section 24 of the Charter of the City of 

Cumberland (1991 Edition) be repealed and reenacted with amendments to read as 

follows: 

 

Section 24. - Publication of summary of ordinances in newspaper; 

posting ordinances on city web site required; when ordinances to take 

effect.  

The mayor and city council of said city shall be vested with the 

power and charged with the duty of making all laws and ordinances not 

inconsistent with the Constitution and laws of the state, touching every 

object, matter and subject within the local government instituted by this 

article.  

Every ordinance imposing any penalty, fine, imprisonment or 

forfeiture for a violation of its provisions shall, as soon as practicable 

after the passage thereof, be published in a newspaper of general 

circulation in the city for two (2) consecutive days. The summary shall 

include the effective date of the ordinance, its subject matter and 

reference to the fact that its entire text is posted on the city’s web site. 

The entire text of all ordinances shall, as soon as practicable after their 

passage, be posted on the city’s web site until such time as the text is 

incorporated into the city code, as maintained on-line. Ordinances passed 

by the mayor and city council shall take effect and be in force from and 

after the date of their passage, unless it shall therein otherwise expressly 

be provided. All ordinances of the city, when posted on the city’s web 

site and bearing on the title pages thereof the words "Ordained and 

published by the Mayor and City Council of Cumberland," or words of 
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like import, shall be prima facie evidence of their authority, and shall be 

admitted and received in all courts and places, without further proof.  

[Note: A text edited version showing the changes made is attached hereto as 

Exhibit A.] 

 

 SECTION 2:  AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the date of the passage 

of this Resolution is _________, 2019, and the amendment of the Charter of the City of 

Cumberland hereby enacted shall become effective on __________, 2019, unless a 

proper petition for a referendum hereon shall be filed as provided by Section 4-304 of the 

Local Government Article of the Annotated Code of Maryland.  A complete and exact 

copy of this Resolution shall be continuously posted on the North Centre Street entrance 

of City Hall, Cumberland, Maryland, until ___________, 2019, and the title of this 

Resolution shall be published in a newspaper of general circulation in the City of 

Cumberland no less than four times, at weekly intervals, before the aforesaid date. 

 SECTION 3:  AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Mayor and City 

Council of Cumberland is hereby specifically directed to carry out the provisions of 

Section 2 hereof regarding the giving of notice by posting and publication of this 

Resolution, approving the same, and, as evidence of said compliance, the City Clerk shall 

cause to be affixed to this Resolution a certificate of the publication in the newspaper in 

which the summary of this Resolution (i.e., its title) shall have been published, and the 

Mayor, if there is no petition for referendum, shall declare the Charter Amendment made 

to be effective on the effective date herein provided for, which is ____________, 2019, 

by affixing his signature hereto in the space provided below the effective date hereof. 

 SECTION 4:  AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that if a proper petition for 

referendum on the Charter Amendment herein proposed is filed, the Mayor and other 

proper officials of the City of Cumberland shall comply with applicable law, including, 

but not limited to, Subtitle 3 of Title 4 of the aforesaid Local Government Article. 

 SECTION 5:  AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that as soon as the Charter 

Amendment shall become effective, either as herein provided or following a referendum, 

the Mayor shall send separately, by registered mail, to the Secretary of the State of 

Maryland, the Maryland State Department of Assessments and Taxation and the 

Department of Legislative Reference of Maryland, a complete certified copy of the text 
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of this Resolution, the date of the referendum, if any is held, a certificate showing the 

number of Councilpersons voting for and against it, and a report on the votes cast for or 

against the amendments hereby enacted at any referendum hereon, and the effective date 

of the Charter Amendment. 

 

 

 THIS RESOLUTION PASSED THIS 19TH DAY OF FEBRUARY, 2019.   

 

      ___________________________ 

      Raymond M. Morris, Mayor 

ATTEST: 

 

______________________________ 

Marjorie A. Woodring, City Clerk 

 

 

 

 

 The Charter Amendment enacted by the aforegoing Resolution became effective 

this ____ day of ____________, 2019. 

 

      ___________________________ 

      Raymond M. Morris, Mayor 

ATTEST: 

 

______________________________ 

Marjorie A. Woodring, City Clerk 

    

 

 I HEREBY CERTIFY, that the aforegoing Resolution, amending the Charter of 

the City of Cumberland, Maryland, was passed the 19th day of February, 2019, with ____ 

votes in affirmation and ____ votes in the negative. 

 

      ____________________________ 

      Marjorie A. Woodring, City Clerk 

 



4 

 

 

 

 I HEREBY CERTIFY, that the aforegoing is a true and exact copy of the Charter 

Amendment Resolution No. _____ passed by the Mayor and City Council of 

Cumberland, Maryland, in Regular Session on the ____ day of _____________, 2019. 

 

 I FURTHER CERTIFY, that there was no petition for a referendum on the 

proposed amendment filed within the required time, and therefore, the same became 

effective on the ____ day of _____________, 2019.  

 

      ____________________________ 

      Marjorie A. Woodring, City Clerk 
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EXHIBIT A 

[Note: Additions to the Charter are capitalized and in bold print and deletions 

are stricken through.] 

 

Section 24.  Publication OF SUMMARY of ordinances in newspapers; POSTING 

OF ORDINANCES ON CITY WEB SITE required; exceptions; when ordinances to 

take effect; admissibility of codification in evidence.  

The mayor and city council of said city shall be vested with the power and charged 

with the duty of making all laws and ordinances not inconsistent with the Constitution 

and laws of the state, touching every object, matter and subject within the local 

government instituted by this article.  

Every ordinance imposing any penalty, fine, imprisonment or forfeiture for a 

violation of its provisions shall, as soon as practicable after the passage thereof, be 

published in every issue of each of two newspapers published in said city for three (3) days 

successively (excluding Sundays), providing the amendments and corrections made in digesting and 

revision for publication in book form need not be so published A NEWSPAPER OF 

GENERAL CIRCULATION IN THE CITY FOR TWO (2) CONSECUTIVE 

DAYS. THE SUMMARY SHALL INCLUDE THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THE 

ORDINANCE, ITS SUBJECT MATTER AND REFERENCE TO THE FACT 

THAT ITS ENTIRE TEXT IS POSTED ON THE CITYS WEB SITE.  THE 

ENTIRE TEXT OF ALL ORDINANCES SHALL, AS SOON AS PRACTICABLE 

AFTER THEIR PASSAGE, BE POSTED ON THE CITY’S WEB SITE UNTIL 

SUCH TIME AS THE TEXT IS INCORPORATED INTO THE CITY CODE, AS 

MAINTAINED ON-LINE. Ordinances passed by the mayor and city council and 

requiring publication shall take effect and be in force from and after the date of their 

passage, unless it shall therein otherwise expressly be provided. All ordinances of the 

city, when printed and published, POSTED ON THE CITY’S WEB SITE and 

bearing on the title page PAGES thereof the words "Ordained and published by the 

Mayor and City Council of Cumberland," or words of like import, shall be prima facie 

evidence of their authority, and shall be admitted and received in all courts and places, 

without further proof.  

   



Regular Council Agenda
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Description

Charter Amendment Resolution (2nd and 3rd readings) - to repeal Charter Section 192-203 

pertaining to the City's governance of the former Memorial Hospital

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

If passed, this Charter Amendment Resolution will become effective upon the 50th day after 

being passed unless a petition is submitted. 

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

 2nd Reading 

 3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)
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CHARTER AMENDMENT RESOLUTION NO. ________ 

 

 A RESOLUTION OF THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF 

CUMBERLAND, MARYLAND, ADOPTED PURSUANT TO THE AUTHORITY 

CONTAINED IN ARTICLE 11-E OF THE CONSTITUTION OF THE STATE OF 

MARYLAND AND SECTION 4-304 OF THE LOCAL GOVERNMENT ARTICLE OF 

THE ANNOTATED CODE OF MARYLAND ENTITLED “A RESOLUTION TO 

REPEAL THE FOLLOWING SECTIONS OF THE CHARTER OF THE CITY OF 

CUMBERLAND (1991 EDITION): SECTION 192 PERTAINING TO THE 

MEMORIAL HOSPITAL BOARD OF GOVERNORS; SECTION 193 OF THE SAID 

CHARTER PERTAINING TO SELECTION OF LAND AND PREPARATION OF 

PLANS; CONTRACTS FOR CONSTRUCTION; SALE OF BONDS; EXPENDITURE 

OF PROCEEDS FROM BONDS; SECTION 194 PERTAINING TO THE 

DEDICATION OF THE HOSPITAL; SECTION 195 PERTAINING TO RULES AND 

REGULATIONS FOR THE OPERATION OF THE HOSPITAL; SECTION 196 

PERTAINING TO CHARGES FOR HOSPITALIZATION; SALARIES OF 

EMPLOYEES; RULES AND REGULATIONS GOVERNING CONDUCT OF 

PHYSICIANS, NURSES, EMPLOYEES; SECTION 197 PERTAINING TO FISCAL 

AFFAIRS OF THE HOSPITAL; SECTION 198 PERTAINING TO THE SUBMISSION 

OF SEMIANNUAL FINANCIAL REPORTS; SECTION 199 PERTAINING TO 

LIMITATION OF LIABILITY OF BOARD OF GOVERNORS AND OF CITY; 

SECTION 200 PERTAINING TO THE ACCEPTANCE OF GIFTS AND BEQUESTS 

BENEFITTING THE HOSPITAL; SECTION 201 PERTAINING TO THE REPEAL OF 

INCONSISTENT ACTS; SECTION 202 PERTAINING TO THE ABOLITION OF THE 

AFORESAID BOARD OF GOVERNORS UPON THE LEASING OF THE 

HOSPITAL; AND SECTION 203 PERTAINING TO THE LEASING OF THE 

HOSPITAL.” 

 SECTION 1:  BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF 

CUMBERLAND, that sections 192-203, inclusive, of the Charter of the City of 

Cumberland (1991 Edition) be, and the same hereby are, repealed. 

 SECTION 2:  AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the date of the passage 

of this Resolution is _________, 2019, and the amendment of the Charter of the City of 
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Cumberland hereby enacted shall become effective on __________, 2019, unless a 

proper petition for a referendum hereon shall be filed as provided by Section 4-304 of the 

Local Government Article of the Annotated Code of Maryland.  A complete and exact 

copy of this Resolution shall be continuously posted on the North Centre Street entrance 

of City Hall, Cumberland, Maryland, until ___________, 2019, and the title of this 

Resolution shall be published in a newspaper of general circulation in the City of 

Cumberland no less than four times, at weekly intervals, before the aforesaid date. 

 SECTION 3:  AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Mayor and City 

Council of Cumberland is hereby specifically directed to carry out the provisions of 

Section 2 hereof regarding the giving of notice by posting and publication of this 

Resolution, approving the same, and, as evidence of said compliance, the City Clerk shall 

cause to be affixed to this Resolution a certificate of the publication in the newspaper in 

which the summary of this Resolution (i.e., its title) shall have been published, and the 

Mayor, if there is no petition for referendum, shall declare the Charter Amendment made 

to be effective on the effective date herein provided for, which is ____________, 2019, 

by affixing his signature hereto in the space provided below the effective date hereof. 

 SECTION 4:  AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that if a proper petition for 

referendum on the Charter Amendment herein proposed is filed, the Mayor and other 

proper officials of the City of Cumberland shall comply with applicable law, including, 

but not limited to, Subtitle 3 of Title 4 of the aforesaid Local Government Article. 

 SECTION 5:  AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that as soon as the Charter 

Amendment shall become effective, either as herein provided or following a referendum, 

the Mayor shall send separately, by registered mail, to the Secretary of the State of 

Maryland, the Maryland State Department of Assessments and Taxation and the 

Department of Legislative Reference of Maryland, a complete certified copy of the text 

of this Resolution, the date of the referendum, if any is held, a certificate showing the 

number of Councilpersons voting for and against it, and a report on the votes cast for or 

against the amendments hereby enacted at any referendum hereon, and the effective date 

of the Charter Amendment. 
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 THIS RESOLUTION PASSED THIS ____ DAY OF _____________, 2019.   

 

      ___________________________ 

      Raymond F. Morris, Mayor 

 

ATTEST: 

 

______________________________ 

Marjorie A. Woodring, City Clerk 

 

 

 The Charter Amendment enacted by the aforegoing Resolution became effective 

this ____ day of ____________, 2019. 

 

 

      ___________________________ 

      Raymond F. Morris, Mayor 

 

ATTEST: 

 

______________________________ 

Marjorie A. Woodring, City Clerk 
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 I HEREBY CERTIFY, that the aforegoing Resolution, amending the Charter of 

the City of Cumberland, Maryland, was passed the ____ day of ___________, 2019, with 

____ votes in affirmation and ____ votes in the negative. 

 

      ____________________________ 

      Marjorie A. Woodring, City Clerk 

 

 

 

 I HEREBY CERTIFY, that the aforegoing is a true and exact copy of the Charter 

Amendment Resolution No. _____ passed by the Mayor and City Council of 

Cumberland, Maryland, in Regular Session on the ____ day of _____________, 2019. 

 

 I FURTHER CERTIFY, that there was no petition for a referendum on the 

proposed amendment filed within the required time, and therefore, the same became 

effective on the ____ day of _____________, 2019.  

 

      ____________________________ 

      Marjorie A. Woodring, City Clerk  



Regular Council Agenda

March 5, 2019

Description

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



Regular Council Agenda

March 5, 2019

Description

Order accepting the bid of Burgmeier's Hauling, Inc. to provide twice a week, curbside garbage 
and recycling collection for three (3) years for an amount not to exceed $1,247,131.08 yearly, 
and bulk item pick-up for three (3) years for a rate of $115/hour; and accepting the bid of 
Mountainview Landfill to provide landfill services for accepting the City's solid waste for a 
cost of $35.25/ton - year 1, $36.31/ton- year 2, and $37.40/ton- year three

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

The service was competitively bid with four bids received on January 23, 2019. Three 
companies submitted bids for waste/recycling hauling and two companies submitted a bid for 
landfill tipping fee.   A spreadsheet showing the proposed costs for Municipal Solid Waste 
Hauling Services Option C is attached.

The Engineering Division recommends that the contract with Burgmeier’s Hauling, Inc. be 
executed for Municipal Solid Waste Hauling Services to include: twice a week curbside 
garbage collection, curbside residential recycling collection and bulk item pick-up services.  

The Engineering Division further recommends that the contract with Waste Management be 
executed for Landfill Services for Project No. 22-18-M.

 Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Hauling Services (Burgmeier's Hauling): 
Year 1 -  $1,247,131.08 
Year 2 -  $1,247,131.08 
Year 3 -  $1,247,131.08 



Bulk Pick-Up:
$115.00 Per Hour

Landfill Services (Waste Management):
Year 1 - $35.25 per ton (plus 3% per year increase years 2 & 3)
Year 2 - $36.31 per ton
Year 3 - $37.40 per ton

Source of Funding (if applicable)



- Order - 
of the 

Mayor and City Council of Cumberland 
MARYLAND 

 

 

ORDER NO.  ____________                    DATE:      __ March 5, 2019_____ 
 

ORDERED, By the Mayor and City Council of Cumberland, Maryland 

THAT the bid of Burgmeier’s Hauling, Inc., 305 N. Lee Street, Cumberland, MD 21502, 

for the “Municipal Solid Waste Hauling Services (Curbside Garbage / Recycling Collection)” 

(Project No. 22-18-M)  to provide twice a week, curbside garbage and recycling collection and 

bulk item pick-up services be and is hereby accepted based on the following amounts: 

 

 I. Hauling to Mt. View Landfill / twice weekly curbside solid waste and recycling 

pickup: 

Year 1 An amount not to exceed   $ 1,247,131.08 

Year 2 An amount not to exceed   $ 1,247,131.08 

Year 3 An amount not to exceed   $ 1,248,131.08 

 

II. Bulk pickup: 

Year 1 $115 / hour 

Year 2 $115 / hour 

Year 2 $115 / hour 

 

 

 BE IT FURTHER ORDERED, that the bid of Mountainview Landfill, Inc., 13300 New 

Georges Creek Road, SW, Frostburg, MD 21532 to provide Landfill Services for accepting 

municipal solid waste from the City of Cumberland relative to Project 22-18-M be and is hereby 

accepted in the following amounts: 

 

 



Year 1 $ 35.25 / ton   

Year 2 $ 36.31 / ton  

Year 3 $ 37.40 / ton  

 

 

 BE IT FURTHER ORDERED, that these contracts shall be for a period of three (3) years, 

beginning July 1, 2019, and may be renewed for two (2) additional one (1) year periods if 

mutually agreed upon by the City and the Contractor(s); and 

 

 BE IT FURTHER ORDERED, that all other bids be and are hereby rejected.  

 

 

 

       ____________________________________ 

      Raymond M. Morriss, Mayor 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Company Company Company Company
Knobley Mountain Hauling, 

Inc.

Western MD Waste 

Systems Burgmeier's Hauling, Inc.

Mountainview Landfill, 

Inc.

405 Plum Run Road 13810 Hazmat Drive P.O. Box 929

13300 New Georges 

Creek Road, SW

Ridgeley, WV 26753 Cumberland, MD 21502 Altoona, PA 16603 Frostburg, MD 21532

Affidavit Submitted Submitted Submitted Submitted

Bid Bond Submitted Submitted Submitted Submitted

Local Preference N/A City City County

RFI 1-4 Submitted Submitted Submitted Submitted

OPTION A- Twice (2) Per Week 

Solid Waste Pick-up  

Mt. View Landfill year 1 884,992.00$                          1,442,307.00$                      1,082,103.12$                  No bid

Mt. View Landfill Year 2 904,996.00$                          1,487,379.00$                      1,082,103.12$                  No bid

Mt. View Landfill Year 3 924,976.00$                          1,533,860.00$                      1,082,103.12$                  No bid

Other Landfill Year 1 768,992.00$                          1,224,887.00$                      1,060,461.00$                  No bid

Other Landfill Year 2 784,996.00$                          1,263,165.00$                      1,060,461.00$                  No bid

Other Landfill Year 3 804,976.00$                          1,302,638.00$                      1,060,461.00$                  No bid

OPTION B- Once (1) Per Week 

Solid Waste Pick-up

Mt. View Landfill year 1 No bid 1,056,237.00$                      1,328,669.04$                  No bid

Mt. View Landfill Year 2 No bid 1,089,244.00$                      1,328,669.04$                  No bid

Mt. View Landfill Year 3 No bid 1,123,283.00$                      1,328,669.04$                  No bid

Other Landfill Year 1 No bid 1,012,471.00$                      1,302,095.64$                  No bid

Other Landfill Year 2 No bid 1,044,110.00$                      1,302,095.64$                  No bid

Other Landfill Year 3 No bid 1,076,739.00$                      1,302,095.64$                  No bid

OPTION C - Twice (2) Per Week 

Curbside Solid Waste & 

Recycling Pick-Up SINGLE STREAM

Mt. View Landfill year 1 1,040,672.00$                       

Mt. View Landfill Year 2 1,064,236.00$                       

Mt. View Landfill Year 3 1,088,156.00$                       

Other Landfill Year 1 924,672.00$                          

Other Landfill Year 2 944,236.00$                          

Other Landfill Year 3 968,156.00$                          

OPTION C - Twice (2) Per Week 

Curbside Solid Waste & 

Recycling Pick-Up DUAL STREAM

Mt. View Landfill year 1 988,147.00$                          2,687,907.00$                      1,247,131.08$                  No bid

Mt. View Landfill Year 2 1,011,246.00$                       2,771,904.00$                      1,247,131.08$                  No bid

Mt. View Landfill Year 3 1,034,416.00$                       2,858,526.00$                      1,247,131.08$                  No bid

Other Landfill Year 1 872,147.00$                          2,470,487.00$                      1,225,488.96$                  No bid

Other Landfill Year 2 891,246.00$                          2,547,690.00$                      1,225,488.96$                  No bid

Other Landfill Year 3 914,416.00$                          2,627,305.00$                      1,225,488.96$                  No bid

City of Cumberland

Municipal Solid Waste Hauling Services (Curbside/Recycling) and Landfill Services (Tipping Fees)

Bid Opening: January 24, 2019, 2:00 p.m., City Hall Council Chambers

City Project No. 22-18-M



OPTION D- Once (1) Per Week 

Curbside Solid Waste & 

Recycling Pick-Up

Mt. View Landfill year 1 No bid 1,817,037.00$                      1,493,697.00$                  No bid

Mt. View Landfill Year 2 No bid 1,873,819.00$                      1,493,697.00$                  No bid

Mt. View Landfill Year 3 No bid 1,932,376.00$                      1,493,697.00$                  No bid

Other Landfill Year 1 No bid 1,773,271.00$                      1,467,123.60$                  No bid

Other Landfill Year 2 No bid 1,828,686.00$                      1,467,123.60$                  No bid

Other Landfill Year 3 No bid 1,885,832.00$                      1,467,123.60$                  No bid

Option E - Curbside Bulk Item 

Pick-Up

Cost per hour 110.00$                                  186.00$                                 115.00$                             No bid

plus 3.1% CPI

LANDFILL LSERVICESLandfill 

Services

Rate per ton No bid 65.00$                                    No bid 35.25$                            

Fix rate? No bid Yes No bid No

Includes landfill services fees? No bid Yes No bid Yes



Trash & Recycling Knobley Mountain 

Hauling HAULING FEE 

Burgmeier's Hauling 

HAULING FEE 

Advanced Disposal 

HAULING FEE

 Mountainview Landfill 

($35.25 per ton 3% 

increase) 

OPTION C
 trash tipping fee (estimated for 8,500 

tons) 

Mt. View Landfill year 1 988,147.00$                         1,247,131.08$                        2,687,907.00$                        $299,625

Mt. View Landfill Year 2 1,011,246.00$                      1,247,131.08$                        2,771,904.00$                        $308,614

Mt. View Landfill Year 3 1,034,416.00$                      1,247,131.08$                        2,858,526.00$                        $317,872

3 Yr Total 3,033,809.00$                3,741,393.24$                   8,318,337.00$                   

Bulk Pick-Up (per hr) 110.00$                           115.00$                             186.00$                             

Option C -Twice (2) Per Week Solid Waste & Recycling



Regular Council Agenda

March 5, 2019

Description

Order appointing Mayor and Council members and City staff as representatives and/or 

appointees to the City's boards and commissions

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



- Order - 
of the 

Mayor and City Council of Cumberland 
MARYLAND 

 

ORDER NO.  ____________                    DATE:       March 5, 2019____ 

 

ORDERED, By the Mayor and City Council of Cumberland, Maryland,   

 

THAT, the following Council Members and staff be and are hereby appointed as 

designated City representatives and/or appointees to the following Boards and 

Commissions: 

 

BOARD / COMMISSION APPOINTEE STATUS 

Allegany County Museum  Raymond Morriss Council Representative 

Allegany County Solid Waste 
Committee 

Raquel Ketterman, 
Environmental Technician 

Staff Representative 

Blighted Property Committee Raymond Morriss Council Representative 

Canal Place Preservation & 
Development Authority  

Raymond Morriss Council Representative 

Cumberland/Allegany County 
Industrial Foundation (CACIF) 

Raymond Morriss Council Representative 

Downtown Development Commission 
(DDC) 

Laurie Marchini Council Representative – Non-voting 
member 

Evitts Creek Steering Committee Raymond Morriss 
Robert Smith Alternate 

Council Representatives – Voting 
members 

Historic Preservation Commission Laurie Marchini M&CC ex officio - Voting member 

Human Relations Commission Eugene Frazier Council Representative – Non-voting 
member 

Human Resources Development 
Commission 

Eugene Frazier Council Representative  

Let’s Beautify Cumberland! 
Committee 

Richard Cioni Council Representative 

Neighborhood Advisory Commission Seth Bernard  
Richard Cioni 

Both voting members 

Parks & Recreation Board Seth Bernard 
Richard Cioni 

Council Representatives – Non-
voting 

Planning & Zoning Commission Seth Bernard M&CC ex officio -  Voting member 
only in case of tie 

Tri-County Council of Western MD  Eugene Frazier Staff Representative 

Western Maryland Scenic Railroad  Eugene Frazier Council Representative 

 

 

_______________________________ 

      Raymond M. Morriss, Mayor 



Regular Council Agenda

March 5, 2019

Description

Order appointing members and alternates to the Evitts Creek Steering Committee

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



- ORDER - 
of the 

Mayor and City Council of Cumberland 
MARYLAND 

 

 

ORDER NO.  ____________                    DATE:    ___ March 05, 2019____  
 

ORDERED, By the Mayor and City Council of Cumberland, Maryland 

THAT, the following be and are hereby appointed to the Evitts Creek Steering 

Committee: 

Member Alternate 

Mayor – Raymond M. Morriss Zach Sloane (WFP Superintendent) 

Council Member – Seth Bernard Robert Smith (City Engineer) 

City Appointee I – Paul Eriksson, Natural 

Resource Technician 

Vacant 

City Appointee II – Steve Resh (Allegany 

College / retired) 

Marie Perrin-Miller (Allegany College) 

Allegany County Soil Cons. Dist. – Adam 

Heavner 

Vacant 

Allegany County Sportsman Club - Guy 

Winterberg 

Harold Hipsley 

 

 

 

      __________________________________ 

      Raymond M. Morriss, Mayor 

 

 



Regular Council Agenda

March 5, 2019

Description

Order adopting a revised Sick and Safe Leave Policy for City employees to modify language 

pertaining to requirements for verification of sick leave for non-union employees

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



- ORDER - 
of the 

Mayor and City Council of Cumberland 
MARYLAND 

 

 

ORDER NO.  ____________                    DATE:    ___ March 05, 2019___  
 

ORDERED, By the Mayor and City Council of Cumberland, Maryland 

THAT, Order 26,410, passed February 19, 2019, to adopt a Sick and Safe Leave Policy 

be and is hereby rescinded; and 

BE IT FURTHER ORDERED, that the attached and revised Sick and Safe Leave 

Policy be and is hereby adopted. 

 

 

 

 

      __________________________________ 

      Raymond M. Morriss, Mayor 

 

 



 

CITY OF CUMBERLAND 

         SICK AND SAFE LEAVE POLICY 
 

Adopted:  February 19, 2019 

 

 

PURPOSE & APPLICABILITY OF POLICY 
 

 This Sick and Safe Leave Policy (“Policy”) was adopted for the purpose of effecting 

compliance with the Healthy Working Families Act (Md. Labor & Employment Code Ann. §§ 3-

1301, et seq.).  Except as otherwise provided herein, the terms of this Policy apply to all 

employees of the City of Cumberland.  Notwithstanding the foregoing, to the extent collective 

bargaining agreements and employment contracts provide greater benefits and protections for 

employees covered by their terms, the benefits and protections provided under those documents 

shall control and shall be interpreted as being applicable to Sick and Safe Leave (as defined 

hereinafter) rather than just Sick Leave. 

 

 The benefits provided under this Policy do not apply to employees who were younger 

than (18) years of age at the start of the fiscal year, except that, as to seasonal employees, the 

benefits provided under this Policy do not apply to such individuals who were younger than (18) 

years of age at the start of the calendar year. 

 

WHAT IS SICK & SAFE LEAVE; WHEN MAY IT BE USED? 
  

 Sick and Safe Leave is more expansive than Sick Leave.  An employee may use it for the 

following purposes: 

 

1. To care for or treat the employee’s mental or physical illness, injury or condition; 

2. To obtain preventative medical care for the employee or the employee’s family 

member; 

3. To care for a family member with a mental or physical illness, injury or condition; 

4. For maternity or paternity leave; or 

5. The absence from work is necessary due to domestic violence, sexual assault or 

stalking committed against the employee or the employee’s family member and the 

leave is being used: (i) to obtain medical or mental health attention; (ii) to obtain 

services from a victim services organization; (iii) for legal services or proceedings; or 

(iv) because the employee has temporarily relocated as a result of the domestic 

violence, sexual assault or stalking. 

 

A “family member” includes: 

 

1.  a biological child, an adopted child, a foster child, or a stepchild of the employee;   

2. a child for whom the employee has legal or physical custody or guardianship;  

3. a child for whom the employee stands in loco parentis, regardless of the child's age;   

4.  a biological parent, an adoptive parent, a foster parent, or a stepparent of the 

employee or of the employee's spouse;   



5.  the legal guardian of the employee;   

6.  an individual who acted as a parent or stood in loco parentis to the employee or the 

employee's spouse when the employee or the employee's spouse was a minor;   

7.  the spouse of the employee;   

8.  a biological grandparent, an adopted grandparent, a foster grandparent, or a 

stepgrandparent of the employee;   

9.  a biological grandchild, an adopted grandchild, a foster grandchild, or a 

stepgrandchild of the employee; or   

10.  a biological sibling, an adopted sibling, a foster sibling, or a stepsibling of the 

employee. 

 

HOW IS SICK AND SAFE LEAVE  

ALLOCATED AND APPLIED? 
 

 Forty (40) hours of paid Sick and Safe Leave will be allocated to full-time employees at 

the beginning of each fiscal year.  Sick and Safe Leave for full-time employees hired after the 

start of the fiscal year shall be prorated based upon their date of hire.   

 

 No more than forty (40) hours of paid Sick and Safe Leave will be allocated to temporary 

and part-time employees at the beginning of each fiscal year or upon the commencement of their 

employment if it commences after the beginning of the fiscal year.  The allocation will be 

predicated upon the number of hours such employees are scheduled to work in that fiscal year.  

They will be granted one (1) hour of leave for every thirty (30) hours they are scheduled to work.  

 

 No more than forty (40) hours of paid Sick and Safe Leave will be allocated to seasonal 

employees at the beginning of each calendar year or upon the commencement of their 

employment if it commences after the beginning of the calendar year.  The allocation will be 

predicated upon the number of hours such employees are scheduled to work in that calendar year.  

They will be granted one (1) hour of leave for every thirty (30) hours they are scheduled to work. 

Seasonal employees may not utilize Sick and Safe Leave for the first 106 calendar days of 

seasonal employment. 

 

 No advances of Sick and Safe Leave other than those described in the preceding two (2) 

paragraphs shall be permitted.  Sick and Safe Leave may not be carried over from year-to-year 

under any circumstance.   

  

All Sick and Safe Leave used will be applied to and shall reduce the amount of an 

employee’s Sick Leave balance.  Sick and Safe Leave must be exhausted before employees will 

be permitted to utilize Sick Leave. 

 

 Employees will not be paid for any unused Sick and Safe Leave upon the termination of 

employment and such leave shall not be credited to their length of service under the Maryland 

State Retirement and Pension Systems.   The preceding sentence shall not be interpreted to affect 

such rights to payment for earned but unused Sick Leave employees may have under the terms of 

collective bargaining agreements, employment contracts or the City’s Handbook for Full-Time 

Non-Union Employees. 

 

 If an employee is rehired within thirty-seven (37) weeks after leaving employment and is 

rehired in the same fiscal year the prior employment ended, any balance of unused earned Sick 

and Safe Leave for that fiscal year shall be reinstated. 



 

 Sick and Safe Leave shall not run concurrently with leave made necessary by personal 

injury received as a result of an accident while in the employment of the City. 

  

WHAT NOTICE/VERIFICATION IS REQUIRED  

IN ORDER TO USE OF SICK AND SAFE LEAVE? 
 

REQUIREMENTS APPLICABLE TO ALL EMPLOYEES 

 

Employees must provide verification that Sick and Safe Leave use was appropriate if it 

was used for more than two (2) consecutive days (shifts). For non-union employees, such 

verification shall be provided by means of a doctor’s certificate stating the date the 

condition began, the date it ended or is expected to end and the extent to which the 

employee is unable to perform the employee’s job (noting the particular job functions the 

employee cannot perform due to the condition) and it must actually be signed by the 

employer’s actual health care provider.  Signature stamps and signatures of others on 

behalf of the health care provider will not be acceptable. For union employees, the 

verification shall be the same as is required for Sick Leave in their collective bargaining 

agreements. No other verifications may be required. 

 

Misuse of Sick and Safe Leave shall constitute grounds for discipline up to and including 

dismissal.    

  

REQUIREMENTS APPLICABLE TO NON-UNION EMPLOYEES 

 

 If the need to use Sick and Safe Leave is foreseeable (for example a scheduled doctor’s 

appointment), the employee must provide notice seven (7) days prior to leave use. Notice must be 

set forth in writing and hand-delivered to the employee’s department head or designated person-

in-charge.   

 

 If the need to use Sick and Safe Leave is not foreseeable, the employee must provide oral 

or written notice to said person within fifteen (15) minutes after the time set for the 

commencement of their work duties or as soon as practicable thereafter if complying with this 

requirement interferes with the employee's ability to use such leave. 

 

 Use of Sick and Safe Leave may be denied if an employee fails to provide the required 

notice and the employee’s absence will cause disruption to the City. 
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