
 AGENDA

MAYOR

Raymond M. Morriss

CITY ADMINISTRATOR

Jeff Rhodes

CITY SOLICITOR

Michael Scott Cohen

COUNCIL

Seth D. Bernard

Richard J. "Rock" Cioni

Eugene T. Frazier

Laurie P. Marchini 

CITY CLERK

Marjorie A. Woodring

DATE: April 16, 2019

I. Open Session

1. 6:15 p.m. - Convene into Open Session

II. Pledge of Allegiance

III. Roll Call

IV. Presentations

1. Comments from Burgmeier's Hauling, Inc. regarding the City's garbage and trash collection program

V. Director's Reports

(A) Public Works

1. Maintenance Division monthly report for March, 2019

2. Utilities Division Flood/Water/Sewer monthly report for March, 2019

3. Shade Tree Commission annual report for 2018

(B) Administrative Services

1. Administrative Services monthly report for March, 2019

(C) Fire

1. Fire Department monthly report for March, 2019

(D) Police

1. Approval of the Police Department monthly report for March 2019

VI. Approval of Minutes

1. Approval of the Closed Session Minutes of December 4, 2018, and January 7, 9, and 10, 2019

VII. Unfinished Business

(A) Ordinances

1. Ordinance (2nd and 3rd readings) - providing for the closure of a portion of a street known as Locust Alley, lying between 
lands owned by ARC Cumberland, LLC and First Peoples Community FCU, upon the request of First Peoples Community 
FCU

VIII. New Business

(A) Orders (Consent Agenda)

1. Order authorizing the Chief of Police to accept a GOCCP Sex Offender Compliance and Enforcement Grant in the amount 
of $19,994.00 for the Cumberland Police Department and Allegany County Sheriff’s Office for overtime support to perform 
compliance checks by conducting home visits of registered sex offenders to confirm residency

2. Order accepting the bid of Weimer Chevrolet for two (2) new F-550 Dump Trucks ($161,780), one (1) new 3/4 Ton Pickup 
($31,585.25), four (4) new 3/4 Ton Service /Utility Trucks ($167,100); American Rent All for one (1) new Skid Steer 
Loader ($28,750.96); and Stephenson Equipment for one (1) new International HV507 SFA Regular Cab 4x4 Dump Truck 
($147,200)



3. Order approving the submission of a request for Community Development Block Grant (CDBG) funding to the Department 
of Housing and Community Development in an estimated amount of $685,000 and authorizing that any additional funding 
received be directed to the Bellevue Sidewalk Improvement Project and that project amounts be decreased proportionately if 
less funding is received

4. Order approving the submission of a request for Community Development Block Grant (CDBG) funding to the Department 
of Housing and Community Development in an estimated amount of $25,000 for the HRDC Emergency Housing Assistance 
project, and authorizing that any additional funding received be directed to the Bellevue Sidewalk Improvement Project and 
that the project amount be decreased proportionately if less funding is received

5. Order authorizing abatement of the 2016-2017 taxes for property at 454-456 Pennsylvania Ave. (Tax No. 04-021509) 
owned by the tax-exempt non-profit organization Archway Station, Inc.

6. Order accepting the bid from Harbel, Inc. for the Koon Dam Sidewalk Repair- Phase 2 (City Project No. 28-18-BR) in the 
estimated unit cost price of $78,500 

7. Order accepting the bid for Gwin, Dobson & Foreman, Inc. for the New Inlet Screen for Gate House Porject (8-19-WFP) in 
the not to exceed cost of $57,000 and rejecting all other bids

IX. Public Comments

All public comments are limited to 5 minutes per person

X. Adjournment



Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

6:15 p.m. - Convene into Open Session

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Comments from Burgmeier's Hauling, Inc. regarding the City's garbage and trash collection 

program

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Maintenance Division monthly report for March, 2019

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

MAINTENANCE DIVISION REPORT  

March 2019 

 
 

Street Maintenance Report 

 

Parks & Recreation Maintenance Report 

 

Fleet Maintenance Report 

 

  
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

PUBLIC WORKS/MAINTENANCE 

STREET BRANCH 

MONTHLY REPORT 

MARCH 2019 

 

� POTHOLES AND COMPLAINTS 

• Potholed 52 Streets & 1 Alley using 13 tons of cold patch 

• Potholed 34 Streets & 1 Alley using 37 tons of hot mix asphalt 

 

� TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS/STREET NAME SIGNS 

• Installed/Repaired 20 Traffic Control Signs 

• Installed 2 Handicap signs 

• Installed/Repaired 2 Street Name Signs 

• Painted 5 curbs 

 

� STREET SWEEPING 

• 330 miles  

• 42 loads 

 

� MISCELLANOUS 

• Completed 102 Work Orders 

• Cleaned Underpass, McMullen Bridge, Washington St Bridge, Fayette St 

Bridge, Cumberland St Bridge & Welch Ave. drainage ditch 4 times.  

• Picked up 8 dead animals 

• Completed tree and brush work in 2 areas 

• Filled salt barrels city wide 1 time 

• Picked up all salt barrels/2 days 

• Salted icy spots 3 separate days 

• Plowed snow during 2 separate snow events 

• Shoveled sidewalks after 2 separate snow events 

• Received & pushed salt loads into storage dome 1 day 

• Picked up trash/discarded furniture on 2 occasions 

• Setup & tear down of traffic control for Hooley Pub Crawl 

• Hauled loads of cold patch from Waxler Rd plant 3 times 

• Started using blacktop from Belt’s Waxler Rd plant on 3/26 

• Cleaned Municipal Center, inside shop, around salt dome & parking lot 

• Added topsoil to ruts in yards caused by our snow plows 2 times 

 

 

 



STREET MAINTENANCE - MARCH 2019 3/1 3/4-3/8 3/11-3/15 3/18-3/22 3/25-3/29 TOTAL 

SERVICE REQUEST COMPLETED    0 16 28 24 34 102 

PAVING PERFORMED TONS           0 

CONCRETE WORK CY           0 

UTILITY HOLES REPAIRED  

WATER       1   1 

SEWER           0 

CY       1.25 y   1.25 y 

TONS           0 

POTHOLES FILLED 

STREETS   16 21 15 34 86 

ALLEYS     1   1 2 

DAYS           0 

Cold Mix   16 22 15 7 60 

TONS         37.0 37 

PERMANENT PATCH 
CY           0 

TONS           0 

COMPLAINTS COMPLETED 

            0 

CY           0 

TONS           0 

TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS 
REPAIRED/INSTALLED       13 7   20 

STREET NAME SIGNS 
REPAIRED/INSTALLED       2     2 

HANDICAPPED SIGNS 
REPAIRED/INSTALLED/REMOVED 

            0 

        2   2 

            0 

PAINTING PERFORMED 

BLUE       2   2 

YELLOW           0 

RED       3   3 

PAVEMENT MARKINGS INSTALLED No.           0 

STREET CLEANING 
LOADS     14 17 11 42 

Miles     111 107 112 330 

SWEEPER DUMPS HAULED TO LANDFILL TONS     33.0     33 

SALT BARRELLS  - PICK UP, FILL DAYS   2   1 1 4 

CLEANED BALTIMORE ST. UNDERPASS     1 1 1 1 4 

CLEAN SNOW EQUIPMENT Days    2       2 

BRUSH REMOVAL/TREE WORK Areas     1 2   3 

Check Drains/Clean Debris DAYS     3   1 4 

LEAF PICK UP Loads           0 
  

Salted icy spots on 3 separate days 

Plowed snow during 2 snow events 

Shoveled sidewalks after 2 snow storms 

Picked up 8 dead animals 

Picked up trash/discarded furniture on 2 different occasions 

Received & pushed salt loads into storage dome 1 day 

Cut & removed trees 2 times 

Setup & tear down traffic control for Hooley Pub Crawl 

Hauled loads of cold patch from Waxler Rd plant on 3 occasions 

Added topsoil to ruts in yards caused by snow plows 2 times 

Cleaned Municipal Center, inside shop, around salt dome, parking lot  

Started using blacktop on 3/26 from Belt's Waxler Rd plant 

  



 

 

 

 

PUBLIC WORKS/MAINTENANCE 

 PARKS & RECREATION 

MONTHLY REPORT 

MARCH 2019 

 

 

 

 

� Constitution Park and Area Parklets 

o Cleaned up garbage 2 times a week 

o Removed several fallen trees & brush in the Park 

 

� Ball Fields 

o Drug  & spiked Cavanaugh Field 2 times 

o Lined Cavanaugh Field 4 times for games 

o Cleaned up Cavanaugh Field & surrounding area 

o Drug & spiked JC Field 1 time 

o Lined JC Field 1 time 

o Cleaned up JC Field & surrounding area 

 

� Miscellaneous Work  

o Assisted in snow removal on 2 occasions 

o Shoveled & salted sidewalks after 2 snow events 

o Performed basic housekeeping @ Municipal Building 

o Cleaned the Craft House & Activities Building 

o Prepared Activities Building for rentals 

o Performed preventative maintenance on trimmers & blowers 

o Prepared feed & bedding for ducks & geese @ the Duck Pond 

o Cleaned & performed preventative maintenance on Park & Rec vehicles 

o Turned water on for Bathrooms @ Mason’s Complex, JC Field & Cavanaugh Field 

o Made repairs to bathrooms @ Mason’s Complex & JC Field 

o Repaired roofs of dugouts @ JC Field 

o Dropped off & picked up trash barrels for Hooley Plunge 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Fleet Maintenance 

March 2019 

  

  Total Fleet Maintenance Projects 132 

    Central Services 0 

    Code Enforcement 1 

    DDC 1 

  

 

Engineering 6 

  

 

Fire 8 

  

 

Flood 7 

    Municipal Parking 0 

    P & R Maintenance 16 

  

 

Police 22 

  

 

Public Works 4 

  

 

Sewer 6 

  

 

Snow Removal 0 

  

 

Street Maintenance 23 

  

 

Vehicle Maintenance  9 

  

 

Water Distribution 4 

  

 

Water Filtration 0 

  

 

WWTP 0 

    Scheduled Preventive Maintenance 22 

    Field Service Calls 3 

  

  Total Work Orders Submitted 48 

  

  Risk Management Claims 0 

  

  Fork Lift Inspections 0 

      



Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Utilities Division Flood/Water/Sewer monthly report for March, 2019

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)











Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Shade Tree Commission annual report for 2018

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)









































Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Administrative Services monthly report for March, 2019

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)























Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Fire Department monthly report for March, 2019

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



Cumberland Fire Department Responded to 96 Fire Alarms:

Responses by District:

District #1 35

District #2 38

District #3 23

96

Number of Alarms:

First Alarms Answered 95

Working Alarms Answered       1

96

Calls Listed Below:

Property Use:

Public Assembly 3

Undetermined 5

Educational 1

Institutional 4

Residential 43

Mercantile, Business 4

Special Properties 36

96

Type of Situation:

Fire 5

Overpressure, Rupture 4

Rescue Calls 50

Hazardous Conditions 6

Service Calls 6

Good Intent Calls 17

False Calls 8

96

Total Fire Service Fees for Fire Calls Billed by Medical Claim-Aid in March: $6,380.00

Total Fire Service Fees for Fire Calls Billed by Medical Claim-Aid Fiscal Year to Date: $23,470.00

Fire Service Fees for Fire Calls Paid In March: $550.00

Total Fire Service Fees for Fire Calls Paid Fiscal Year to Date: $6,350.00

Fire Service Fees for Inspections and Permits Billed in March: $350.00

Fire Service Fees for Inspections and Permits Paid in March: $0.00

Total Fire Service Fees for Inspections and Permits Paid Fiscal Year to Date: $1,450.00

REPORT OF THE FIRE CHIEF FOR THE MONTH OF MARCH, 2019

Prepared for the Honorable Mayor and City Council and City Administrator

District #1
36%

District #2
40%

District #3
24%

Fire Calls by District

District #1

District #2

District #3



Cumberland Fire Department Responded to 419 Emergency Medical Calls:

In City Calls 403

Out of City Calls 16

Total 419

Cumberland Fire Department provided 7 Paramedic Assist Calls:

1 Paramedic Assist Calls within Allegany County

6 Paramedic Assist Calls outside of Allegany County

7

Cresaptown VFD 1

Fort Ashby VFD, WV 2

Ridgeley VFD, WV 2

Short Gap VFD, WV 1

Wiley Ford VFD, WV 1

7

Cumberland Fire Department provided 9 Mutual Aid Calls:

7 Mutual Aid Calls within Allegany County

2 Mutual Aid Calls outside of Allegany County

9

Bowman's Addition VFD 5

Flintstone VFD 1

District #16 VFD 1

7

Cumberland Valley EMS, PA 1

Ridgeley VFD, WV 1

9

Total Ambulance Fees Billed by

Medical Claim-Aid for March: $111,514.00

Ambulance Fees Billed Fiscal Year to Date: $1,078,005.72

Ambulance Fees Paid:

Revenue Received in March: $90,766.33

FY2019 Ambulance Fees Paid in FY2019: $609,524.64

Total Ambulance Fees Paid in FY2019: $767,412.20

(All ambulance fees, current and previous fiscal years, paid in FY2019.)

96%
4%

Inside/Outside City



Fire Calls in the Month of March for a Five-Year Period

2015 2016 2017 2018 2019

District #1 37 47 41 37 35

District #2 42 38 38 44 38

District #3 28 20 29 25 23

Out of City 0 0 1 1 0

Total 107 105 109 107 96

Ambulance Calls in the Month of March for a Five-Year Period

2015 2016 2017 2018 2019

Inside of City 433 436 405 419 403

Outside of City 39 29 33 11 16

Total Emergency Medical Calls 472 465 438 430 419
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Fire and Ambulance Calls in the Month of March for a Five-Year Period

2015 2016 2017 2018 2019

Fire Calls 107 105 109 107 96

Ambulance Calls 472 465 438 430 419

Total Calls 579 570 547 537 515

Training:

Training Man Hours: 183.00

Sexual Harassment Policy 1.00

Duties and Responsibilities 4.50

Crew Meeting 20.00

Hose Operations 22.00

Pump Operations 16.50

Apparatus Check Procedures 22.00

SCBA Inspection and Care 5.50

SCBA Donning Methods 11.00

General Driver Training 2.00

Spinal Immobilization 10.00

General Fire Prevention 6.00

Post Incident Review 19.00

Physical Fitness 15.00

Rescue Tools 9.00

High Angle Rescue 14.50

Water Supply 5.00

183.00

Fire Prevention Bureau:

Complaints Received 3

Conferences Held 59

Correspondence 12

Inspections Performed 14

Investigations Conducted 2

Plan Reviews 3

Personnel:

Nothing to report.

Statistics Compiled by Julie A. Davis, Fire Administrative Officer
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Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Approval of the Police Department monthly report for March 2019

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)









Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Approval of the Closed Session Minutes of December 4, 2018, and January 7, 9, and 10, 2019

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)











Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Ordinance (2nd and 3rd readings) - providing for the closure of a portion of a street known as 

Locust Alley, lying between lands owned by ARC Cumberland, LLC and First Peoples 

Community FCU, upon the request of First Peoples Community FCU

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

 2nd Reading 

 3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Order authorizing the Chief of Police to accept a GOCCP Sex Offender Compliance and 
Enforcement Grant in the amount of $19,994.00 for the Cumberland Police Department and 
Allegany County Sheriff’s Office for overtime support to perform compliance checks by 
conducting home visits of registered sex offenders to confirm residency

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



- Order - 
of the 

Mayor and City Council of Cumberland 
MARYLAND 

 

 

ORDER NO.  ____________                    DATE:       April 16, 2019_ 
 

ORDERED, By the Mayor and City Council of Cumberland, Maryland 

THAT the Chief of Police be and is hereby authorized to accept a GOCCP Grant 

for FY20 entitled “Sex Offender Compliance and Enforcement in Maryland” in the 

amount of Nineteen Thousand, Nine Hundred Ninety-four Dollars and No Cents 

($19,994.00) for the period 07/01/2019 to 06/30/2020, to assist in developing and 

implementing strategies specifically intended to provide assistance complying with the 

laws surrounding the Sex Offender Registry, and to support personnel and contractual 

services.  

 

 

       ____________________________________ 

      Raymond M. Morriss, Mayor 

 

 
 

 

 

Grant: SOCM-2020-0008 

 











Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Order accepting the bid of Weimer Chevrolet for two (2) new F-550 Dump Trucks ($161,780), 
one (1) new 3/4 Ton Pickup ($31,585.25), four (4) new 3/4 Ton Service /Utility Trucks 
($167,100); American Rent All for one (1) new Skid Steer Loader ($28,750.96); and 
Stephenson Equipment for one (1) new International HV507 SFA Regular Cab 4x4 Dump 
Truck ($147,200)

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

The Department of Vehicle Maintenance / Public Works has reviewed all bids and recommends 
the awards noted above.  

 Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Total bid award = $536,416.21

Source of Funding (if applicable)

Department of Public Works



- ORDER - 
of the 

Mayor and City Council of Cumberland 
MARYLAND 

 

 

ORDER NO.  ____________                    DATE:    ___ April 16, 2019___  
 

 

ORDERED, By the Mayor and City Council of Cumberland, Maryland 

THAT, the bids for the below listed utility vehicles, solicited through the “2019 

Request for Bids – Utility Vehicles,” be and are hereby accepted in the following amounts 

not to exceed: 

Vehicle(s) Company Amount not to exceed 

Two (2) New F-550 Dump 

Trucks 

Weimer Chevrolet $80,890 each /          $ 161,780.00  

One (1) New ¾ Ton Pickup 

Truck 

Weimer Chevrolet $  31,585.25 

Four (4) New ¾ Ton 

Service/Utility Body Trucks 

Weimer Chevrolet $41,775 each /            $ 167,100.00  

One (1) New Skid Steer 

Loader 

American Rent-All $   28,750.96  

One (1) New International 

HV507 SFA Regular Cab 4x4 

Dump Truck 

Stephenson 

Equipment 

$ 147,200.00  

TOTAL BID AWARD  $ 536,416.21 

  

BE IT FURTHER ORDERED, that all other bids be and are hereby rejected. 

 

 

      __________________________________ 

      Raymond M. Morriss, Mayor 

 

 



Company

Two (2) New F-550 Dump 

Trucks

One (1) New 3/4 Ton Pickup 

Truck

Four (4) New 3/4 Ton 

Service/Utility Body Trucks

One (1) New Skid Steer 

Loader

One (1) New International 

HV507 SFA Regular Cab 4x4 

Dump Truck Affadavit

Local 

Preference

Mar-Eco Inc., dba Keystone Ford

301 Walker Road 85,589.00$                             33,229.00$                               40,320.00$                                  NO BID NO BID N/A

Chambersburg, PA  17201 43,397.00$                                  

(with fuel tank)

West Central Equipment-Kris Long, Sales

729 Red Goose Road NO BID NO BID NO BID 30,592.33$                         NO BID N/A

Somerset, PA  15501

Weimer Chevrolet of Cumberland

10355 Mt. Savage Road, NW 80,890.00$                             31,585.25$                               41,775.00$                                  NO BID NO BID COUNTY

Cumberland, MD  21502 LOW BID LOW BID LOW BID w/PREFERENCE

Lindsay Ford, LLC

11250 Viers Mill Road 86,000.00$                             31,600.00$                               NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A

Wheaton, MD  20902

Allegheny Trucks

239 Greenwood Road NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 153,386.25$                             N/A

Altoona, PA 16602 (after $750 rebate)

Stephenson Equipment, Inc.

7201 Paxton Street NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 147,200.00$                             N/A

Harrisburg, PA  17111 LOW BID

American Rent All

219 Mechanic Street NO BID NO BID NO BID 28,750.96$                         NO BID CITY

Cumberland, MD  21502 LOW BID

2019 Request for Bids - Utility Vehicles
Bid Opening:  March 13, 2019 - 2:30 p.m., City Hall Council Chambers

Page 1 of 2



Beltway International, LLC

208 Market Street NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 170,123.00$                             CITY

Cumberland, MD  21502

Page 2 of 2
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April 16, 2019

Description

Order approving the submission of a request for Community Development Block Grant 
(CDBG) funding to the Department of Housing and Community Development in an estimated 
amount of $685,000 and authorizing that any additional funding received be directed to the 
Bellevue Sidewalk Improvement Project and that project amounts be decreased proportionately 
if less funding is received

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



- Order - 
of the 

Mayor and City Council of Cumberland 
MARYLAND 

 

 

ORDER NO.  ____________                    DATE:     _____April 16, 2019____ 
 

ORDERED, By the Mayor and City Council of Cumberland, Maryland 

THAT, the following request for Community Development Block Grant (CDBG) 

funding be and is hereby approved for submission to the Department of Housing and Community 

Development for 2019 CDBG entitlement funding in an estimated amount of Six Hundred 

Eighty-Five Thousand Dollars ($685,000); and 

BE IT FURTHER ORDERED, that the final award amount is unknown at this time, 

therefore, funding received over the estimated expected amount will be directed towards the 

Bellevue Sidewalk Improvements Project; if the final amount received is under the estimated 

expected amount, all estimated project amounts shall be decreased proportionately to equal the 

final award amount; and 

BE IT FURTHER ORDERED, that the Mayor be and is hereby authorized to execute 

all documents pertaining to the application for submission and award documents. 

 

PROJECT NAME AMOUNT FUNDED 

PHA Fort Cumberland Homes Sidewalk Improvements $50,000.00 

ACM ADA Work Experience Loft Lift Project $40,000.00 

YMCA Gilcrist Ph 5 Baltimore Street Playground $77,000.00 

YMCA Riverside Rehab: Roofing/Fence $270,750.00 

Constitution Park Grove 4 Inclusive Playground $27,000.00 

Administration $132,000.00 

Indirect Cost-City $0.00 

Fair Housing/EOE Effort  $10,000.00 

Associated Charities Long Term Prescription $8,750.00 

Associated Charities Short Term Prescription $7,800.00 

Summer @ Your Library: South Cumberland $2,000.00   



Incredible Years & Dina Parenting : The Family Junction $10,000.00 

Associated Charities Food Pantry $3,200.00 

FCRC Domestic Violence/Sexual Assault Services $10,500.00 

AHEC Dental Access $8,000.00 

AHEC Denture Program $7,000.00 

Horizon Goodwill Job Training Program $21,000.00 

TOTALTOTALTOTALTOTAL    $685$685$685$685,000.00,000.00,000.00,000.00    
 

 

 

 

 

 

       ____________________________________ 

      Raymond M. Morriss, Mayor 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 



Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Order approving the submission of a request for Community Development Block Grant 
(CDBG) funding to the Department of Housing and Community Development in an estimated 
amount of $25,000 for the HRDC Emergency Housing Assistance project, and authorizing that 
any additional funding received be directed to the Bellevue Sidewalk Improvement Project and 
that the project amount be decreased proportionately if less funding is received

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



- Order - 
of the 

Mayor and City Council of Cumberland 
MARYLAND 

 

 

ORDER NO.  ____________                    DATE:     _____April 16, 2019____ 
 

ORDERED, By the Mayor and City Council of Cumberland, Maryland 

THAT, the following request for Community Development Block Grant (CDBG) 

funding be and is hereby approved for submission to the Department of Housing and Community 

Development for 2019 CDBG entitlement funding in an estimated amount of Twenty-five 

Thousand Dollars ($25,000); and 

BE IT FURTHER ORDERED, that the final award amount is unknown at this time, 

therefore, funding received over the estimated expected amount will be directed towards the 

Bellevue Sidewalk Improvements Project; if the final amount received is under the estimated 

expected amount, all estimated project amounts shall be decreased proportionately to equal the 

final award amount; and 

BE IT FURTHER ORDERED, that the Mayor be and is hereby authorized to execute 

all documents pertaining to the application for submission and award documents. 

 

PROJECT NAME AMOUNT FUNDED 

HRDC Emergency Housing Assistance $25,000.00 

TOTALTOTALTOTALTOTAL    $25$25$25$25,000.00,000.00,000.00,000.00    
 

  

 

 

 

 

 

       ____________________________________ 

      Raymond M. Morriss, Mayor 

 



 
 

 

 

 

 

 



Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Order authorizing abatement of the 2016-2017 taxes for property at 454-456 Pennsylvania Ave. 

(Tax No. 04-021509) owned by the tax-exempt non-profit organization Archway Station, Inc.

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

Source of Funding (if applicable)



- ORDER - 
of the 

Mayor and City Council of Cumberland 
MARYLAND 

 

 

ORDER NO.  ____________                    DATE:    ___ April 16, 2019___  
 

ORDERED, By the Mayor and City Council of Cumberland, Maryland 

THAT, the 2016-2017 taxes for property at 454-456 Pennsylvania Avenue, Tax 

Account No. 04-021509, owned by the tax-exempt non-profit organization Archway Station, 

Inc., be and are hereby abated. 

 

 

 

      __________________________________ 

      Raymond M. Morriss, Mayor 

 

 









Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Order accepting the bid from Harbel, Inc. for the Koon Dam Sidewalk Repair- Phase 2 (City 
Project No. 28-18-BR) in the estimated unit cost price of $78,500 

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

It is the Engineering Department's recommendation to award the Koon Dam Sidewalk Repairs 
Phase 2 to Harbel, Inc. in the estimated unit cost price of $78,500.00.  This project was 
formally bid and the only proposal received was from Harbel, Inc.

 Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

$78,500.00

Source of Funding (if applicable)

002.299D.63000



- Order - 
of the 

Mayor and City Council of Cumberland 
MARYLAND 

 

 

ORDER NO.  ____________                    DATE:     ___April 16, 2019____ 
 

ORDERED, By the Mayor and City Council of Cumberland, Maryland 

 

THAT, the bid from Harbel, Inc., 11521 Milnor Avenue, Cumberland, MD 21502, 

for the Koon Dam Sidewalk Repairs - Phase 2 (City Project No. 28-18-BR) in the 

estimated unit cost price of Seventy-Eight Thousand, Five Hundred Dollars ($78,500) be 

and is hereby accepted. 

 

 

 

 

      ____________________________________ 
      Raymond M. Morriss, Mayor 

 

 

 

 

Source of Funding:  002.299D.63000 

 

Order of Bids: 

Contractor Amount 

Harbel, Inc. $78,500 

 

 



Company Total Bid Add Alternate 1 Affidavit

Local 

Preference Addendum

Bid Bond / 

Check

Harbel, Inc. 78,500.00$                        5,250.00$                               Yes County Yes Yes

1 Milnor Avenue

Cumberland, MD 21502

The appropriate department will review all proposals and provide a recommendation to  

the Mayor and City Council for award based on the lowest and most responsive bid received.

City of Cumberland
Bid Opening: April 10, 2019 2:30 p.m., Cumberland City Hall Council Chambers

Koon Dam Sidewalk Repairs - Phase 2
City Project No. 28-18-BR



Regular Council Agenda

April 16, 2019

Description

Order accepting the bid for Gwin, Dobson & Foreman, Inc. for the New Inlet Screen for Gate 
House Porject (8-19-WFP) in the not to exceed cost of $57,000 and rejecting all other bids

Approval, Acceptance / Recommendation

It is the Engineering Department's recommendation to award City Project 8-19-WFP New Inlet 
Screens for Gatehouse to the apparent low bidder Gwin Dobson & Foreman in the not to 
exceed cost of $57,000.00.  Two other bids were received from WRA in the amount of 
$218,805 and from The EADS Group in the amount of $109,500.  

 Budgeted 

1st Reading 

2nd Reading 

3rd Reading 

Value of Award (if applicable)

$57,000

Source of Funding (if applicable)

002.299A.20100



- Order - 
of the 

Mayor and City Council of Cumberland 
MARYLAND 

 

 

ORDER NO.  ____________                    DATE:     ___April 16, 2019____ 
 

ORDERED, By the Mayor and City Council of Cumberland, Maryland 

 

THAT, the bid from Gwin, Dobson & Foreman, Inc., 3121 Fairway Drive, 

Altoona, PA 16602, for the New Inlet Screens for Gate House Project (8-19-WFP) in the 

not to exceed cost of Fifty-Seven Thousand Dollars ($57,000) be and is hereby accepted; 

and 

BE IT FURTHER ORDERED, that all other bids be and are hereby rejected. 

 

 

 

 

 

      ____________________________________ 
      Raymond M. Morriss, Mayor 

 

 

 

 

Source of Funding:  002.299A.20100 

 

Order of Bids: 

Contractor Amount 

The EADS Group $109,500 

Gwin, Dobson & Foreman $57,000 

Whitman, Requardt & Assoc. $218,805 

 

 




