FY2015 Liability / Fleet / Property Insurance

Bid Opening: May 21, 2014 - 2:30 p.m., City Hall Council Chambers

Listed below are the preliminary results of the bid opening of May 21, 2014. All bids will be reviewed and a department recommendation

will be forwarded to the Mayor and City Council for final approval.

Livengood, Devore & Co.
1214 National Highway
LaVale, MD 21502

CBIZ Benefits & Ins Services
44 Baltimore Street
Cumberland, MD 21502

LGIT
7225 Parkway Drive
Hanover, MD 21076-1317

Affidavit Yes Yes Yes
Local Preference County City N/A
Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount

| Elevators- General Liability No Bid 396.00 | S 305.00
II. [Public Officials Liability No Bid 14,358.00 No Bid
Ifl. [Law Enforcement Liability No Bid 30,652.00 | § 35,575.00
IV. |Buildings and Contents 135,387.00 No Bid | S 124,079.00

Flood and Earth No Bid No Bid | S 13,230.00

Boiler and Machinery Included in buildings No Bid | S 14,889.00

Police K-9 Included in buildings No Bid | S 1,288.00

Mobile Equipment Included in buildings 5,125.00 | $§ 1,308.00

TOTAL BID SECTION IV 135,387.00 5,125.00 | $ 154,794.00
V. |Parking Garages (Building and Liability) 4,083.00 No Bid | § 8,307.00
VI. |Fleet Coverage

General Fleet 76,573.00 No Bid $48,994 Liability / $43,355 Comp, Collision

Fleet Augmented Coverage 8,399.00 No Bid No Bid

Total Fleet 84,972.00 No Bid | $ 48,994.00
VIl. |TOTAL BID All Sections 224,442.00 50,531.00 | $§ 247,975.00




